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Fire House First 

Under New Systelll 

WILLIAM LONG, the County Supervisor for FHA presents H. T. Taylor, President of the Allen­

ton Volunteer Fire Deportment, with a check for $15,000 to be used with personal funds for 

the purchase of a new pumper truck. Shown from left to right ore; Delton Morgon, George 

Word, Mut McNeil!, Richard Fleming, H.T. Taylor, Rodford Allen - District Supervisor of FHA, 

Jomes West, William J. Long County Su ervisor of FHA, Cassius Williams -Assistant County 

Supervisor of FH~. 
Lumberton Robesonion Photo 

Allenton fire Dept. Gets 

New Pumper Truck 

Allenton-The Allenton 
Volunteer Fire Department has 
a new pumper fire truck in 

1""'4._...__. ... --• tlliDa tlD a 
$15,000 loan from the Farmers 
Honie Administration. 

its district, as well as homes, 
barns and rural stores. 

The brand new truck 

alu-aab u. bu ¥• ...... aay 
action beyond customary 
practices, already registers 
2,274 miles on its meter. Fire 
Chief Delton Morgan and 

President of the fire depart­
ment, H. T. Taylor drove the 
tnx:k from the manufacturers 

in Cbica&o 1aat week. 
The firemen, gathered along 

with FHA representatives to 
celebrate the arrival and were 
treated to a steak supper. 

Anderson Creek 
Harnett County is the site of the 
first rural fire station com­
pleted under Farmers Home 
Administration financing. 

At dedication ceremonies for 
the Anderson Creek Fire 
Station recently, Paul V. 
Parks, chief of community 
programs for FHA, told a 
gathering of fire department 
members, patrons and county 
officials that of 16 loans ap­
proved for fire departments 
during the last fiscal year, four 
were in Harnett County. 

He explained, however, that 
the program got off to a late 
start, and said that probably 70 

to 80 such loans would be made 
during the current fiscal year. 

Parks was introduced by 
David Tyre, county supervisor 
for FHA, who praised the 
county commissioners, countv 
attorneys and other for their 
parts in malring the facility a 
reality. 

Parks noted that other 
community projects could also 
come under the program as 
presently administered. 

Also speaking were Com­
missioner Chairman Jack 
Brock, Commissioner Bobby 
Etheridge, Bill Shaw, a 
member of the department and 
contractor for the building, Guy 
Cayton, treasurer for the fire 
department, and othPr<1 

Brock said the com­
missioners were pleased with 
the growth and orol!ress of 
rural departments in the 
county and pledged all possible 
support by the county govern­
ment. Etheridge said he was 
glad to see the people "work 
together for the benefit of all 
involved." 
He noted that some m~mbers 

of the fire department were 
military personnel, not even 
taxpayers in the county but 
none the less willing to donate 
their services. 

Shaw gave a brief resume of 
the department's history, from 
its conception two members of 
the Anderson Creek !,ions Club, 
in 1970. He also thanked all 
supporters of the efforts of the 
firemen. 

During Parks' talk, the FHA 
official explained the 
provisions under which his 
agency was able to make loans 
for buildings and equipment to 
rural departments at five 
percent interest. 

He was installed as an 
honorary fire chtef by Chief 
Charles Moyers. 

Land for the station was 
donated by the Overhills 
developers. 

About 200 persons were on 
hand for the ceremon.ies, and 
later a dance and open house 
were held. The Rural Development Act 

of 1972 authorized the FHA to 
make loans to rural fire 
departments. Allenton is the 
second fire department to 
benefit from the federal act; 
Lumber Bridge has also 
received such a loan. Loans to 
Britts and Fairmont Fire 
Departments are also in 
process. 

·Final Inspection Made 

The Allenton Fire Depart­
ment was established to 
provide protection to the area 
in a four mile radius, but has 
been extended to cover the 
Wishart Townships as well The 
volunteer unit is responsible for 
nine mobile home parks within 

Pre-Fire 
Planning 
Important 

Mecklenburg County -
There is a fine line between a 
fire insP,ection and pre-fire 
planning. However, as Fire 
Inspector Dale K. Readling of 
the Mecklenburg County Fire 
Administrator's Office knows, 
this "fine line" is one of the 
most important areas in Fire 
Prevention. Inspector Readling 
has been instrumental in set­
ting up the "pre-fire plan" 
program and surveys in 
Mecklenburg County. 

Continued On Poge 12 

~bulon - A final inspection 
~ the renovation to the 1.ebulon 
Municipal Building and con- · 
struction of the new firehouse 
was staged recently in a three 
and one-half hour tour and 
examination of the facilities. 

Present for the inspection 
were the architect, con­
!ilf'uction coordinator, con­
tractors, and town officials. A 
brief meeting was held in the 
upstairs meeting room of the 
Municipal Building just prior to 
the inspection. Joining the tour 
were Donald Horton, Assistant 
Town Manager, Zebulon; 
Douglas Y. Perry, owner, 
Douglas Y. Perry Associates; 
Eugene Hunter, Construction 
Coordinator, Douglas Y. Perry 
Associates; H. Clay Taylor, 
Partner, Environmental 
Planning Associates; Bill 
Jones, Vice President, Ray 
Sparrow Construction Co., 
George Albury, Foreman, Ray 
Sparrow Construction Co., Ray 
Moore, President, Mechanical 
Associates; Nathan Hicks, 
Owner, Tar River Heating & 
Air Conditioning; and Phillip 
Boswell Electrical Foreman, 
Edwards Electric Co. 

"There are still a few punch­
list items left to be completed 
before the contractors can be 
released," said Douglas Perry, 

Architect. "These include such 
things as hardware for the 
doors and cabinets, an 
overhead fan on order for the 
fire station, and some minor 

Making final inspection 

adjustments in other phases of 
the construction." Perry said 
that all of these finish-up 
projects should be completed 
by this Friday, when a short 

inspection will be taken of the 
punch-list items. 

The buildings have been 

Continued On Page 12 

Assistant Town Manager Donald Horton and architect Douglas Y. Perry joined contractors 

in making the final inspection at the Zebulon fire station and municipal building. 

' Zebulon Record Photo 
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Editorial 

EMILY H. KING 
FOR SALE CHEAP: One 

invisible black cat, who 
evidently attached himself to 
my premises sometime around 
July 11th and remained there 
for succeeding weeks. Anyone 
interested may obtain same, by 
just a simple phone call to your 
Editor. Will be happy to help 
him find a new home - he has 
been here ft.r too long! 

For Example: On July 11th, 
my husband was working on a 
repair job on a lime kiln in 
Franklin, Va. <this is the kind 
of lime that will eat the meat 
right off your bones>. A laborer 
on the floor beneath him tossed 
a shovelful of lime directly 
under an Air Shaft over which 
my husband was working -
you know where the lime came 
up, don't you? Right in his 
eves: For three weeks after 
c~ming out of the Hospital he 
was under the daily care of an 
eye Specialist in Suffolk, and 
we are very thankful there was 
no permanent loss of sight, but 
it was an anxious .three weeks. 

cut to pieces, as there was 
almost none of it left in the 
window - I did have a split 
second to think my time had 
come! 

The body shop ordered a new 
door, and I left the car and 
returned to New Bern, since he 
said it would probably be 
Tuesday before it would arrive, 
however, it would only be a 
matter of 5-6 hours after that, 
before I could have car, so I 
returned to Wilmington the 
first of the week, staying at a 
Motel to wait for the car. Know 
how long I was stranded in that 
Motel with no transportation? 
All the rest of that week, 
thinking each day I would get it 
back, about to climb the walls 
by Friday P.M. at 5:30 when I 
finally got it back! 

Needless to say, all these ups 
and downs have sadly affected 
my work, but now, I am back in 
harness again and hopeful 
nothiq else eventful will upaet 
the apple cart. I always heard 
you couldn't keep a good gal 
down, and I'm back up and with 
you again, and hope you will 
forgive my using Editorial 
space to tell you all my recent 
troubles, but thought you might 
like to know. Maybe that black 
cat was riding with me in 
Wilmington, and I got rid of 
him, there. If any of you run 
across him, just keep him, 
please, or give him away, 
because I really don't need him 
.,mymore! 

Emily~- Kini 
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Safety Measure In Mobile Homes 

Automatic Smoke Detectors 
Now Required 

Capt. H. T. Link of the Statesville Fire Department, surveys a mobile home destroyed by fire 
which might have been contained if a smoke detector hod been in use. 

StatesviJle - The rule 
requiring automatic smoke 
detectors to be placed outside 
each sleeping area in all mobile 
homes went into effect Sept. 1, 
and the rule will be applicable 
to conventional dwellings on 
Jan. 1, 1975. 

Statesville Fire Qlief Frank 
Crowson said the trouble 
detectors would emit a signal of 
not less than 85 decibels at a 
distance of 10 feet and praised 
the ruling as "a good way to . 
save many lives." 

Crowson examined a letter 
received from North Carolina 
Insurance Commissioner John 
Ingram notifying all city and 
county fire chiefs, building 
inspectors and electrical in­
spectors of the designated 
changes in the state building 
code as adopted by the state 
building code council. 

The amendment to require 
smoke detectors on mobile 
homes was adopted by the 
council March 11 and became 
effective Sept. 1. 

The amendment requiring 
smoke detectors on con­
ventional dwellin~s was 

Statesville Record & Landmark Photo 

adopted June 11, and becomes 
effective Jan. 1, 1975. 

The letter from Ingram 
stated: "The council has 
adopted an amendment which 
will require what they judge as 
the most effective smoke 
detector by requiring that it 
..... vlalble and inviaible 
particles of combustion and 
also will require, in their 
judgment, the most dependable 
power source, that of electrical 
house current, for the majority 
of persons who are owning or 
renting homes or apartments." 

The letter continued: "In 
order to provide for evaluation, 
testing and follow-up inspection 
in the factory of smoke 
detectors which are 
manufactured to meet this 
requirement, the council 
amendment requires such units 
to be listed by a nationally 
recognized testing laboratory, 
with products evaluation which 
provides periodic inspection 
and labeling of listed smoke 
detectors." 

Crowson was provided a list 

Continued On Page 11 

SMOKE DETECTOR! 
REQUIRED - Amendment tc 
the state building code ho1 
required smoke detectors 
such as the one held b) 
Statesville Fire Chief Rran• 
Crowson, in all mobilt 
homes manufactured ofte1 
Sept. l . New conventiona 
dwellings will be require< 
to have the detectors as o 
Jon. 1, 1975. 

Next Example: Just a few 
weeks after he went back to 
work, while I was in 
Wilmington. I had an accident, 
and received the first citation 
of my life' I really was not 
guilty. but since I had no wit• 
nesses and the other driver had 
his wife with him, it was two 
against one. and there was just 
no way. except by common 
-;ense. I could prove I didn't run 
a red light. but who, in the 
world. would stop for a red 
light. sit there and wait for it to 
1 urn. then run it before it did? I 
was so shook up, sitting there in 
the midst of shattered glass, I 
guess I would have let them 
charge me with anything! It 
was quite a shock to look up just 
as I entered the intersection, to 
see .the front of a big cadilac 
just before smashing into the 
door I was sitting beside - I 
only had time to throw myself 
over to one side to avoid the 
breaking glass. Thank heavens, 
it was safety glass, which was 
all that saved me from being 

Multi-Pronged Effort Launched 

Wayne Firemen ·To Lead 
Crime Prevention Drive 

Goldsboro - Wayne County 
Firemen's Association recently 
pledged to help spearhead a 
county-wide crime prevention 
campaign. 

The decision by the firemen 
signaled the go-ahead for a 
multi-pronged effort aimed not 
only at preventing crime but 
also at expediting convictions 
and bringing pressure for 

sterner punishment of 
criminals. 

Groundwork for the cam­
paign was laid earlier by 
representatives of law en­
forcement agencies, the in· 
dustrial community and the 
Goldsboro News-Argus. 

But all agreed that success of 
the campaign would depend on 
full-scale support of the rural 

fire departments. 
"You men represent every 

community in Wayne County 
and the best people in Wayne 
County. Without you, this thing 
won't work," declared W. R. 
Helms, president of Dewey 
Brothers. 

Earlier, Eugene Price, editor 
of the Goldsboro News-Argus 
admonished the group: "If we 

don't get together and run thi1 
<criminal) element out, we'r 
going to see Wayne County an 
our state become anoth~ 
satellite for 9rganized crime. 

Price referred to th 
dynamiting of an SBI agent ~ 
Salisbury yesterday morninl! 
He noted that the agent h 

Continued On Page 1 1 
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laze Strikes Hot Rod Barn1 

Mount Airy-The Hot Rod 
Barn, 768 West Lenanon Street, 
Mount Airy, was literally 
destroyed by fire of un­
determined origin recently at 3 
o'clock. 

According to Fire Chief Bill 
Joe Woodruff, the block 
structure was owned by the Joe 
Greenwood estate, while the 
business itself was owned and 
operated by Dorsey Jones of 
Mount Airy. 

Chief Woodruff stated that 
the fire was reported by Wayne 
Greenwood, who lives next door 
to the place of business. 

When the local firemen 
arrived, Chief Woodruff said, 
"we found the fire was coming 
out the front of the building. 

"Heavy fire streams brought 
the fire under control in a short 
time," he said. 

The building included a large 
room-a display area-in front 
and a storage area in back, 
Chief Woodruff said. 

. The fire was concentrated in 

the front room, while the 
storage area suffered mostly 
heat and smoke damage. 

Cause of the fire, Chief 
Woodruff stated°, is un­
determined. The damage has 
not yet been estimated, he said. 

Unofficial sources put the 
damage to the building and 
contents in the several 
thousands of dollars category. 

The inside portion of the 
building was heavily damaged, 
as was the structure, Cheif 
Woodruff said. The blaze broke 
through the roof in several 
locations. 

Firemen remained on the 
scene about one hour and 45 
minutes, the chief said. Two 
trucks and 23 men were 
dispatched to the scene. · 

There were no injuries in­
curred during the fire-fighting 
operations. 

The Mount Airy Police 
Department was dispatched to 
the scene, handling the traffic 
details. ., 

Donated by Friends 
of the Murfreesboro FD 

Murfreesboro - Back Packs, 
brooms, mops, portable 
generator for night lighting and 
salvage covers. While it may 
sound like a peculiar shopping 
list, these are among the items 
the Murfreesboro Volunteer 
Fire Department will purchase 
with funds raised in order to 
furnish the . new equipment 
truck. The men have raised 
$900 in September, with $95 
coming from the Ladies 
Auxiliary. 

The town supplies equipment 
required by the state. but the 
department felt the new unit 
was needed and raised the 

$5,700 for it. Saturday ,they 
operated a road block, sold 
home and auto fire ex­
tinguishers, and the ladies held 
a bake sale. When the new unit 
is put into service, lettering on 
it will read "Donated by 
Friends of the Murfreesboro 
Fire Department." Those 
friends may still contact any 
fireman with additional 
donations or mail them to the 
department. And what is a 
"salvage cover?" It is a heavy 
piece of canvas thrown over 
store merchandise or home 
furnishings to minimize the 
damage during a fire. 

Briggs Grocery 
Meats - Produce - Notions - Drugs - American Gos 

6 om to 10 pm PHONE 693-5373 
RFD 1 Oxford, N. C. 

GLENOIT MILLS, INC. 
bivlsion of Botany Industries, Inc. 

Tarboro, North Carolina 

This is the fire-gutted building on West "Lebanon Street housing the Hot Rod Barn. Couse of 
the early morning blaze is undetermined. 

CAROLINA 
FURNITURE MART . 

Phone 735-2541 

125 E. Sycamore 

LINCOLNTON, N . C . 

Bracewell 
Furniture 
Co., Inc. 

Conover, N. C. 

HAYWORTH­

MILLER 

FUNERAL SERVICE 
Diol765-8181 

331 5 Si las Creek Parkway 

WINSTON-SALEM, N. C. 

WELCOME 
SERVICE STATION 

Hollins Blevins, Owner 
Minor Auto Repolrs 

Groceries 
New & Used Ti, .. 

Rood Service 

693-6317 101 lewis 
Oxford, N. C. 

Red Pig 
Barbecue 
Drive In 

Dial 782-1263 

24 Corban Ave. S.E. 

CONCORD, N.C. 

Mount Airy Times Photo 

HEREINOWI 
Lightweight! Super Compact! 

ZENITH-It's Handcrafted 

12" Personal Portable TV 

Less Thon A Foot High! 
The Discoverer, Model Y -1405 

THE COMPANION SERIES 

WARREN 
DISTRIBUTING CORP. 

828-9100 • 226 Glenwood Ave. 
Roleigh, N.C. 

ROCKWELL FEED 

SERVICE, INC. 

Phone 279-2953 

Roilrood St. 

Quolity Feed For Animols 

Rockwell, N.C. 

H. R. JOHNSON 
Contractors 

Commercial, Industrial-Institutional 
Free Estimates 

Old Hwy74 Doil 283-8178 Monroe, N. C. 

MAGLA PRODUCTS ~·I.ii..-------- Manufacturers of Quality Household Products 
" Church Street & Main 

Huntersv-ille, North Carolina 

BURLINGTON 

CHEMICAL 

COMPANY 

Golden Age 
Nursing Home, Inc. 

Sam McBride, 
Owner 

Bright Sunny Rooms • New 
Modern-fireproof 

Privote - Seml~Privote 
Piped For Oxygen Tl1•ropy 

. Reosonoble Rotes 

Telephone 584-0111 
Box 111 

Burlington, North Carolina 

2-4 Hour Profeuiona1 Service 

Whol .. am. M410II • Speclol 
. Diets • Planned Adlvities 
licensed By State of N. C. 

Memb41r of State & Notional Assn. 
Doctors On Coll 

Dial 9 56-1132 Cow Palace Rood 
LEXINGTON, N. C. 

WETHERINGTON'S STORE 
Top Quality Groceries Meats 

Open 7 Days A Week 6 o.m. - 9 p.m. 
Dial 637-9166 

AURORA RD NEW BERN, N. C. 

Prospect Rood 

CAROLINA 
CONTAINER 

COMPANY, INC. 
HIGH POINT, N. C. 

Phone 883-7146 

-

... 
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$2,000 Damage 

Vandals Strike KSD Building 
Kannapolis - Vandals made Broken glass covered the 

a 5ham~les of the Kannapolis floor and bits of it clung to the 
Sanitary District office and fire furniture and big red fire 
!-lation on Floyd St. recently. engines. 

TOM'S MOBILE 

HOME SALES 
N.C. Franchised Dealer 

for 
Yukon Delta Houseboats 

Two Locations 
Jct. 33 & 306 
Aurora. N.C. 
Hwy. 17 S. 

New Bern, N.C. 
Phone 919-322-5661 

FOREST'S 
STEAK BARN 

Cracked windshields formed 
tiny spider webs, one hood was 
dented and chrome was 
damaged on both the trucks. 

An estimated $2,000 damage 

UNIVERSAL 

MANUFACTURING 

COMPANY 

SHELBY, N.C. 

- -... ,. ----Steak-Seafood 
Barbecue 

Infra-Red Heat 

Catering to 
Banquets & Parties 

THE 

CLAYTON­

MARCUS 

COMPANY, INC. 

Fire Truck Damaged, Windows Shattered ... At Least 74 Rocks Thrown During Attack 
Kannapolis Independent Photo 

10 o.m.-10 p.m. (Closed Mon.) 
PHONE 553-7470 

Hwy. 70 E.-Cloyton. N.C. 

A&G 
Printery 

Established 1958 

Phone 483-5874 

367 Winslow St. 

Fayetteville, N. C. 

NASH 

HOME 
24 Hour Nursing Care " 

Ambulatory & Bed Patients 
Modern Facilities 

Mr. and Mrs. John W. 
Barrett, 

Operators 
Phone 459-3317 

Hwy 64 East 
NASHVILLE, N. C. 

Do not leave a fire unattended! 

Compliments of 
A 

FRIEND 

Manufacturers of 

Fine Upholstered Furniture 

Call 328· 1126 

HICKORY, N.C. 

TILE INC. 
OF 

FAYETTEVILLE 

Stylon-Genuine Ceramic Tile 

Manufacturers of Wei-Croft 

Cultured Mcd>el--

646 Wlndslow St. 

FAYETTEVILLE, N.C. 

ASHEBORO 
CARPET 

& 

SUPPLY 
COMPANY 

Dial 919-625- 1120 

1721 South Fayetteville St. 
Asheboro. N. C. 

FIVE POINTS 
MILLING CO, 

HARGm 
MILLING CO. 

638-2119 
1019 Queen St. 

NEW BERN, N.C. 

MONROe T .~ 

OIL 
COMPANY 

TIRES-BATTERIES 

ACCESSORIES 
AMERICAN HEATING OILS 

519 EAST FRANKLIN ST. 
MONROE, N. C. 

SUMMER 
HILL 

GOLF 
CLUB 

Telephone 431- 1963 

Route 3 

High Point, N.C. 

SNACK BAR 
' Famous For Our Delicioous Chicken Barrel Or Basket" 

• 4 Locations • 

No. 1--1346 W. First Ave .. S.W.- W. Hickory. N.C. 

No. 3 - Hwy. 70 W.-Conover. N.C. 

No. 4 Hwy. 6470 8 32 I - Hickory. N.C. 

No. 6- Hwy. 181, N. - Morgonton, N. C. 

SPARKY'S 

HARLEY-DAVIDSON 
Motorcycle Soles & Service 

Phone 273-17 43 2401 S. Elm St. 
GREENSBORO, NORTH CAROLINA 

was done, and Everette Murph, 
chairman of the. district's 
governing board, noted that 
there was no insurance to cover 
it. 

"This is an expense the 
sanitary district must bear," 
he said. "Our insurance will not 
cover this type vandalism." 

Rosie Horton of Horton 
Grading discovered the broken 
windows on his way to work 
about 6:30 a.m. and notified 
sberttre• 119t,11tt- a, Nonla 
Kannapolis. 

At least 74 rocks - some of 

Cofield 

Brothers 
Funeral Home 

Phone 536-3171 

Weldon. N. C. 

LITTLE RIVER 

OIL CO. 

Disbributors of 

Ci Igo Petroleum Products 

Phone 735-0893 

GOLDSBORO, N. C. 

them weighting from eight to 10 
pounds - went through 34 
windows and two doors. Six of 
the windows were the eight foot 
ones along the front of the of­
fice. 

The outside light was broken, 
and guttering on the roof was 
knocked loose. Many rocks also 
lay .on the roof. 

Surveying the damage to the 
trucks and doors that sllde 

~ a \ii.Jr Wre'fu':i, 
to wonder aloud what would 
have happened if there had 
been a fire call. 

"If a fireman had rushed in 
and thrown up the sliding door, 
glass would have rained down 
in him," Harrington com­
mented. 

This is the third time the 
station has been damaged by 
vandals. About three and a half 
years ago, juveniles were taken 
into custody following one such 
incident, and about 18 months 
ago two bowling balls were 
thrown through a window. 

Troy S. Malpass 

&Sons 

Phone 243-5731 

1104 Downing 

Wilson, N. C. 

HILLHAVEN 
CONY ALESCENT CENTER, INC. 

Charles M. Lemaster, Adm. 
Diol 724-2821 - 1900 W. First zSt. 

Winston-Solem, N. C. 

Cooper's Mobile Home 
Moving Service 

"IT IT'S MOBILE - WE MOVE IT" 
Phone Doy or Night 828-0761 or 553-7363 Clayton, N. C. 
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HEAVY DAMAGE - This was the scene os Dunn firemen spent three hours fighting o'bloze 
at the home of Marvin Tort near Jonesboro Road northeast of the Dunn city limits. 

Dunn Dispatch Photo 

Night Blaze HeOvily 
Damages Dunn Home 

Dunn - A one-story, brick 
veneer home owned by Marvin 
Tart just northeast of the Dunn 
city limits was heavily 
damaged by fire by un• 
determined origin recently. 

The alarm was received 
about 9 p.m. and Dunn firemen 
were at the scene in a matter of 

• """'arlnu-, but the bi. .. 

The fire is believed to have 
started near the roof in the area 
near the chimney, destroying 
the entire roof. A large portion 
of the interior escaped the 
flames, but sustained extensive 
smoke and water damage. 

Tentative estimates placed 
the damages at least $25,000. 
The entire roof and all interior 
walls will require replacement. 

Firemen said that an 
unidentified person had ap­
parently kicked open the front 
door and saved a considerable 
amount of the contents before 
the truck arrived. 

The location, on a secondary 
road about a mile off Jonesboro 

Compliments of 

AAMCO 
TRANSMISSIONS 

Phone 485-5109 
1 <J6 Brood Foot Ave. 
FAYETTEVILLE, N.C. 

ANSEL'S · 
Refrigeration 

Co. 
COMMERCIAL 

SALES & SERVICE 
Phone 27 4-0353 
ASHEVILLE, N. C. 

Road, and for most of the way 
in only able to accommodate 
one-way traffic, made the 
house more difficult to reach. 

Fifteen firemen, a pumper, 
tanker and equipment truck 
spent more than three hours at 
the scene. 

The flames were visible from 
a conaiderabJe distance. 

· · to the cause 

still underway. 
Although a number of in• 

terested spectators drove to the 
area of the fire, they were kept 
out of the way and apparently 
did not interfere with the 
equipment. Most parked near 
the -beginning of the narrow 

Thies Realty & 
MortageC. 

Wachovia Bank Bldg. 
Phone 372-3030 
Charlotte, N. C. 

section of roadway and walked 
into the fire. 

There were no reported in­
juries. 

First Savings 
&Loan 

Security And Service 
Since 1887 

212 E. Broad St. 
Statesville, N. C. 

GUILFORD BUILDERS 

SUPPLY CO., INC. 

Phone 273-9481 

1621 Battleground Avenue 

GREENSBORO, 

NORTH CAROLINA 

R. G. WHITLEY & SON. INC. 
(Gilbert & Dick) 

. Peanuts -Fertilizer - Dolly Hog Market 
CALL' 398-3244 Como, N. C. 

Modern Carving Co., Inc. 

Phone 476-7358 
1100 Unity Street 

Thomasville, North Carolina 

SKYLINE DRIVE-IN 

RESTAURANT 
Steaks- Sandwiches- Pizzas 

Phone 692-6643 HENDERSONVILLE, N. C. 707 Greenville Hwy. 
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GILLIKIN CRAFT, INC. 
Jomes T. and Jimmy Gillikin-Owners 

A Complete Line of Soil and Motorboats 
Boat Dealer• Sales and Service 

Morine Hardware and Ski Equipment 
Riggins-Fittins-Soils 

Ski Boats To Pleasure Yachts 
726-7284 Beaufort, N. C. 

Bryant-Durham 
Electric Co., Inc. 

INDUSTRIAL AND COMMERCIAL 
DURHAM, NORTH CAROLINA 

A-1 CLEANERS 
Phone 346-6728 

Highway 17, South 

Jacksonville, N. C. 

Hickory 

Construction 

Co., Inc. 

Phone 327-9107 

Hickory, North Carolina 

BUSH 
BROTHERS 

Industrial Plating 
Automatic Plating 

Nickel-CJRP 
Nickel-Chromium 
Bross- Lacquering 

349-8314 • 342-1326 
107 N.E. Market 
Reidsville, N.C. 

HIGHLANDS 

INN 

COME ST A Y WITH US 
WE OFFER THE BEST OF 

For Reservations Coll 
(704) 526-9380 

Or Write ... Box 1030 
HIGHLANDS, N. C. 

Robinson & 
Murray 

Machine 
Service, Inc. 

Phone 864-4306 
4015 S. York Rd. 
GASTONIA, N.C. 

NORTH 

STATE 
TELEPHONE 
COMPANY 

High Point, N. C. • 

MORRIS HOME 
RESTAURANT 
& OYSTEn BAR 
Located At HUNT'S MOTEL 

Telephone 446-8168 
Highway 301 South 
Rocky Mount, N. C. 

ATLANTIC 
TOBACCO 
COMPANY 

VENDING MACHINES 
THAT SERVE THE PUBLIC 

DAY&NIGHT 

Dlal 762-3748 
1901 Dawson Street 
WILMINGTON, N.C. 

BRADY'S RESTAURANT 

1505 East Franklin 
CHAPEL HILL, NORTH CAROLINA 

-

_, 

... ... 
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Fire Dam ages Home 
Ta)'lorsville-A fire recently 

caused damages estimated at a 
couple of thousand dollars to a 
four-room house owned by J. D. 
Barnes and located near L. E. 
Herman's store just off N. C. 16 
north of Taylorsville. 

Stokes 
Mortuary 

Phone 446-7144 

207 Albermarle Avenue 
Rocky Mount, N. C. 

The Tayiorsville Volunteer 
Fire Department was sum­
moned at about two o'clock and 
found smoke coming from the 
dwelling from a fire that had 
erupted in the bedroom. 

Firemen weren't certain of 

SIDES 
MOBILE 

HOMES 
MT. AIRY, N. C. 

WINSTON-SALEM, N. C 

HOME SAVINGS & LOAN ASSN. 
NORTHGA TE & LAKEWOQD SHOPPING CENTERS 

Diol 682-9161. 321 Chapel Hill, Durham, N. C. 
Locations Also At 

Chapel Hill and Roxboro, N. C. 

WESTMORELAN_D-HAWKINS 
FUNERAL SERVICE 

Member: Anociat«td Funeral Directors Service 

Over 80 Yeors Service & Experience" 

Serving Notion-Wide Mutual Benefit Burial Aun 
220 S. Mo;n St. DIAL Anytime 652-3161 Morion, N, C. 

the cause but speculated that 
the flames may have erupted 
when burning materials fell 
from a chimney opening into a 
clothes hamper in the bedroom. 

A wood fire was burning in a 
stove in an adjoining room and 
the chimney also had an 
opening into the bedroom. 

Firemen theorized that bur-

smoke coming from the house 
and firemen credited L. E. 
Herman and Jimmy Jolly with 
saving the house from greater 
destruction. They used a 

A MMONS 
EXTERMIN ATING CO. 

Termites Extel'minoted 

Free Estimates Bonded. 

Free Inspection 

Phono 664,2832 

7'24S.Moin 

MOoTe~viHe Nor,h CoroHno 

Midway 

Restaurant 
Specializing In A 

Complete Men:., Of 
Home Cooked Meals And Pies 

FIRE DAMAGES HOUSE - Flames erupted in a four-room, frame house just off N.C. 16 nor­
th near L. E. Herman's Store recently. The house, owned by J. 0. Barnes, was damaged an 
estimated "couple of thousand dollars," with o bedroom and its furnishings destroyed. 
Above, firemen remove some of the burned contents of the bedroom while other burned 
items including a mattress ore in the yard. 

Norlina Road 

Norlina Rood Dial 257-3279 

WARRENTON, N.C. 

CO NCRETE SERVICES 

Red Springs 
M otor Inc. 

Dial 843-5125 

Red Springs, N. C. 

O F ROCKY MOUNT, INC. 

Standard 
Automotp,e 

Parts Co. 
Crankshaft Grinding 

Machine Shop Service 
Goldsboro. N. C. 
Fremont. N. C. 

Pfizer, Inc. 

SPECIAL CHEMICAL 
DEPARTMENT 

CHEMICALS DIVISIO N 

21 10 High Point Road 
GREENSBO RO, N . C. 

Sand-Stone-Concrete Since 1946 
Phone 442-3733 

Highway 301 North · 
Rocky Mount, North Carolina 

J.B. POPE 
GARAGE 

Phone 585-2786 

RFD 1 

SEABOARD, N.C. 

DUMAS GIDDENS 

OIL CO. 

Phone 735-0571 

Box 1296 

GOLDSBORO, N.C. 

GLOBE ALBANY CORPORATION 
And Albany International Company 

"Quality Conveyor Belting For Over 50 Years" 
CALL 722-2578 2080 E. 5th St. 

Winston-Salem, N. C. 

STANDARD 
Trucking Company 

CHARLOTTE, NORTH CAROLIN A 

Taylorsville Times Photo 

nlng mate rials could have 
fallen through the chimney's 
opening into the clothes 
hamper, igniting the bedroom. 

Most of the bedroom and the 
furnishings in the room were 
destroyed. 

Nobody was home at the time 
of the fire but neighbors 
responded when they saw 

Coastal 
LumberCo. 

Call 536-3117 

WELDO~. N.C. 

CHURCHWELL'S 
INC. 

Jewelers 
*Certified Gemologist 
• American Gem Society 

"Fine Jewelers In 
The Hear t Of Wilson" 

110 E. Nash St. 
Wilson. N. C. 

garden hose to squ\rt water 
onto the flames until firemen 
arrived. 

Taylorsville firemen an­
swered a call at about 11:15 a. 
m. to a car burning near the old 
Zachary Fabric Shop toward 
the Highland Section of 
Taylorsville. 

A spokesman for the fire 
department said that a 1973 
Oldsmobile driven by Barbara 
Barker of Taylorsville caught 
fire while she was driving down 
the road. 

He said she reported that she 
had been having some trouble 
with the car but the trouble had 
not been detected. The fire 
burned out most of the wiring, 
the spokesman said. Damages 
were estimated at $500. 

HELP YOU SAVE MONEY 
With Our Own Masonry 
Crews & Steel Erectors 

Commercial-Industrial 
Institutional 

Metal Buildings 

415 Southbound St. 
249-2181 • Lexington, N.C. 

DAIRYMEN, INC 

SOUTHEAST DIVISION 
207 Robbins Street P. 0 . Box 4095 

Greensboro,N.C.27406 
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Electric Blanket 

Blamed for Fire 
Roxboro- A Longhurst 

resident probably thought his 
electric blanket was doing quite 
a job keeping him warm 
recently, when the blanket 
a pparently malfunctioned, 
causing a fire which did about 
$1,000 worth of damage to his 
home. 

The fire was reported to the 
Roxboro Fire Department at 
6:30 a.m. It occurred at the 
home of Kerry Humphries on 
School Street in Longhurst. 

Firemen have theorized that 
the electric blanket on Hum­
phries' bed had a short circuit, 
which caused the blaze . 
Humphries was reportedly in 
bed when the fire broke out. He 
was not injured. 

Damage was mainly 
restricted to the bedroom of the 
house. Damage was estimated 
at $500 worth to the building 
and $500 worth to the contents. 

BUNN 

PULPWOOD YARD 

SALVAGING BELONGINS-Sifting through belongings of Miss Iva Wilson, whose fire-gutted house on Long Creek Roods is 
in the background, friends and relatives search for salvageable goods. Gaston Rural Police suspect burglary and arson. 

Gastonia Gazette Photo 

SAW TIMBER- LUMBER 

PULPWOOD 

HARD& PINE 

TIMBER LAND 

TIMBER CRUISING 

Phone 496-3968 or 496-3646 

BUNN,N.C. 

Burglar sets fire to house 
Gastonia-A burlar ap­

parently set fire to a house on 
t°ng Creek Road in western 

aston County recently after 
tealing a television set and 

Wright School 

tooms Destroyed 
Durham-A fire destroyed 

two classrooms in the Wright 
School on Roxboro Road 
recently. No injuries were 
reported. 

Fire officials said the blaze 
was under investigation for 
possible arson. 

The school, a state-supported 
institution for emotionally 
disturbed children, has been 
using facilities at Butner since 
April while the Roxboro Road 
building was being renovated. 

School officials had planned 
to move back to Burham later 
this fall, but a contractor on the 
scene said damage would delay 
the reopening. 

Fire officials said the blaze 
was confined to two classrooms 
in the front of the building, but 
said the entire building and the 
basement haJi- smoke damage. 

There were no visible signs of 
damage to the exterior of the 
building. 

Fire officials said the blaze 
was reported shortly after 6 
p.m. The fire was extinguished 
within minutes after firemen 
arrived, according to assistant 
Chief S. J. Smith. 

No estimate of the damage 
was available. 

The 4-room home of Miss Iva 
Wilson was gutted by flames, 
but neighbors and firemen 
removed several items of 
furniture before the fire con­
•-ed the entire frame '-· 

Gaston Rural Patrolman T. 
R. Choat said that neighbors 
told him· they saw the flames 
around 2:30 p.m., called the 
Tryonata Volunteer Fire 
Department and began 
removing furniture. 

Concord Names 

New Fire Chief 
Concord - Francis Wed­

dington has been named 
Concord Fire Chief, filling the 
vacancy left by the death of 
John Fisher. 

Weddington is a 32-year 
veteran on the Concord force. 

Weddington had been serving 
as acting chief until the Board 
of Aldermen recently promoted 
him. 

RIVENBARK 
MOTOR 

COMPANY 
•PONTIAC 

eGMCTRUCKS 

•MOBILE HOMES 
Phone 293-4544 
102 College St. 
WARSAW, N.C. 

I 
EAST COAST SALES CO., INC. 

Quality Mobile Homes 
PHONE 398-3198 PHONE 332-4424 PHONE 357-2531 

Murfreesboro, N.C. Ahoskie, N.C. Gatesville, N.C. 

A television normally on a 
stand in the living room was 
missing, when neighbors en­
tered the burning home, and 
Miss Wilson descovered a pistol 
miNin& aft.er the fire, Choat 
said. 

Miss Wilson was at work 
when the fire started. Firemen 
said that fire destroye.d another 
home on the same site 10 years 

BULLOCK'S 

BAR-B-CUE 

Al I Kinds of Bar-B-Cue 
Dial 383-3211 
3330 Wortham 
Durham, N. C. 

TRIPLETT 
CONSTRUCTION 
Builders & Controcton 

Residential•Comme.rcial 
Free Estimates-VA-FHA 

Your Plans or Ours 

Call Eugene Triplett for 
Personal Service 

Mobile Phone 838-2934 
RFD 1 (Drag Strip Rd.) 
Home Phone 973-3462 

Wilkesboro, N.C. 

C. W. KIRKLAND 
PLASTERING CO. 

Phone 525-9332 -
4850 Old Pineville 

Rood 

Charlotte, North 
Carolina 

ago and she rebuilt the smaller 
home which was destroyed. 

Police have no suspects. 

W.D. 
BROOKS, 

INC. 
Gulf Oil 

PHONE 642-2322 
607 S. Thompson St. 

Whiteville, N.C. 

66 
PACKAGE 

Store 
Domestic & Imports 

Complete Line of 
Groceries 

Wines-Beer 
Ice-Gasoline 

Phone 295-7985 
Boone Hwy. 

Blowing Rock, N.C. 

COBB-HEARD 
REAL ESTATE 

m 
'REALTORe 

Homes-Acreage. 
Rentals 

Condominiums­

Building Sites 

Appraisals 

Call M. Earl Hea4d 

526-3751 4 15 Main St. 

Highlands, N.C. 

Telephones tn Every Room - Air 
Conditioning - Frff T elevlslon . 

Tub and Shower - King Size 
Mattress .. · Wall To Wall Corpet· 

Swimming Pool - 66 Modern Units . 
Lorge Confer-,,ce Room. 

Owned and Operoted by Mr. and 
Mn. Otis Evons and son. David. 

Phone 623-9161 
WE WELCOME YOU 

Adjoining MarGre Restaurant 
213 South Van Buren Road 

(Hwy. 14, North) Edere, N; C. 

" Slaw Up and Show Up" Don't Make This Vacation The Last For You 
And Your Family Or Anyone Else 

Sponsored By 

CRAVEN COUNTY 
HOSPITAL 
NEW BERN, NORTH CAROLINA 

HARRINGTON 
MANUFACTURING COMPANY 

Specializing In Tobacco Horvflling, 
Automatic Tobocco Primer And lulk Borns. 

The System Of The future. 
Oak Rood DIAL 397-2531 

Lewiaton, North Corolino 

-

,J 
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Fire damages 
Siler City Mills 

Sikr City-A major fire was 
averted recently at Siler City 
l\lills as the results of quick 
action by the Siler City Fire 
Department and an excellent 
sprinkler system at the local1 

teed plant. 
Firemen responded to the 

call at 6: 20 a .m. when a fire 
starting in an elevator shaft 
sent flames up to a room near 
the top floor of the building. 

The efficient operation of the 
sprinkler system was credited 
with retaining the flame until 
firemen arrived at the scene. 

Firemen scrambled to the 
roof of the building and quickly 
subdued the fire, preventing 

Dick Parker 
Ford, Inc. 

Best Fords In Town 

Phone 447-3177 

HAVELOCK, N. C. 

Owned & Operated by 
the Eastern Band of 

the Cherokee Indians 

Boundary Tree 

Lodge & Motel 

DINlf;IG ROOM 
SWIMMING POOL 

CHEROKEE, N.C. 
located on U.S. 441 H,;.,y. N. 

at the Smoky M ountoins Pork 

J . P. SHEPPARD 

& ASSOCIATES, 

INC. 

Machine Shop 
Production Machine Work 

Grinding-Welding Assembly 

Cal l 867-8381 
29-74 Kings Mountain Hwy. 

GASTONIA, N . .£. 

the flames from spreading to 
other areas of the huge 
structure. Firemen remained 
at the scene until around 10 
a.m. 

According to Ray Swain, 
general manager, extensive 
damage was done to the room 
near the top of the building with 
other areas suffering heavy 
water damages. Damages were 
estimated to the around $70,000 

The plant resumed limited 
production Tuesday after 
repair crews worked 
throughout the weekend. 

Fire Departments at Silk 
Hope and Bonlee also answered 
the call on a standby basis. 

Firemen reported intense 
heat near the top of the 
building; however, the fire was 
knocked down within 30 
minutes following the arrival of 
firemen. 

-

FRANKLIN 

MACHINE CO. 
"We Fix Anyth ing­

Anywhere 
Depot Street­

Phone 524-23 13 
Franklin, N . C. 

ONE HOUR CLEANER! 

& LAUNDRY INC. 

308 E. Nash St . 

& 305 W. Nach St. 

Call 237-0227 

WILSON, N.C. 

cox 
RADIATOR CO. 

Phone (919) 272-9919 

420 Battleground Ave. 

GREENSBORO, N.C. 

-

HILLCREST FURNITURE, INC. 
CALL 464-9500 

Con~ver, North Carolina 

KITTY HAWK FISHING PIER 
& 

A VALON FISHING PIER 
CAll 441-4101 - Kill Devil Hills, N. C. 

BRENDLE'S 
INC. 

~ · 

Jewelers & Distributors• The Catalog Showroom 
331 Standard St. Elkin, N. C. 

2610 Peters Creek Parkway-Winston-Salem, N.C. 
871 Highland Ave. Hickory, N. C. 

1501 E. Bessemer Ave. Greensboro, N. C. 
Executive Office & Warehouse 1919 N. Bridge St. Ext. 

Serving Piedmont, N. C. Elkin. N. C. 
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The figures of three Siler City Firemen can be seen silhouetted by flames at an early morning 
f ire a t Siler City M ills. Firemen battled the flames from the roof top of the building sided by 

the railroad tracks. 
Pittsboro Chatham Record Photo 

Comp/·ments I 

Meadowview Memorial Park 
THRUWAY 

SHOE 
REPAIR 

CALL 693-8191 Old Durham Rd. 

Oxford. North Ca rolina 

,_MIZE MOTORS.- 1--~ 

INC. 
Chevrolet 

Sales Service Parts 
Complete Body Service 

CALL 632-3323 
541 Boulevard 

Eden, N. C. 

SIXTEEN 
SUPER MARKET~ 

& 
SERVICE STATION 

Washington St. Ext. 
CALL 459-2550 
Nashville, N. C. 

Phone 725-5720 
310 South 

Stratford Road 
Wln•1 

KDS 
RED& WHITE 

FOOD STORES 

MEYERS YARNS, INC. 

Complete Supermarket 
From Camp Geiger 

Trailer Park 

Open 7 Days-8 a.m. to 9 p.m. 
TEXTURIZED YARNS 

Phone (704) 826-2911 
Hwy 52 & Gray Fax Trail 
Ansonvi lle, N. C. 28007 

PHONE 347-6631 
Jacksonville, N .C. 

BENNETT 
BOX 
co. 

CALL 332-5026 
N. Railroad St. 

Ahoskie, N.C. 

W .E. Stanley 

Pension Planning 

Co., Inc. 

Phone 273-9492 

1 009 W. Market St. 

GREENSBORO, N.C. 

Kiser 
Exterminating 

Co. 
Termite & Pest Control 

locally Owned 
Norman B. Kiser, Mgr. 

license No. 362 PW 
Free Inspection & Estimates 

. PHONE 599-2381 
Pine Lakes RJxboro, N. C. 

Davis Wood 
Products, Inc. 

HUDSON, N. C. 

CAROLINA SOLITE 
CORPORATION 

AQUADALE PLANT 
ALBEMARLE, NORTH CAROLINA 

KRAFT CONVERTERS, INC. 
The Complete line Of 

Protective Packaging & Cushioning Products 
High Point & Maxton, N. C. 
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DAMAGE EXTENSIVE - Statesville firemen water down contents from the home of Her­
man Gabriel at 457 N. Tradd St., which burned recently at 7:48 p.m. One bedroom was com­
pletely destroyed and the remainder of the home was damaged by smoke and heat. 

Statesville Record & landmark Photo 

Short Circuit Ruled Cause Of Enka Fire 
A fire which destroyed 

Edgewood Baptist Church in 
Enka recently was caused by 
an electrical short circuit in a 
closet on the second floor of the 
education unit, Enka Fire Chief 
Houston Blackwell said. 

The $150,000 building was 
gutted by the fire which was out 
of control by the time 

firefighting units arrived at the 
scene about 9 a.m., Blackwell 
said. 

According to the pastor, the 
Rev. Robert Evans,. regular 
evening worship services were 
held Sunday night at the church 
and the building was checked 
as late as 10 p.m. and found in 
order. 

GUTTED EDGEWOOD BAPTIST CHURCH 
Asheville Citizen Photo 

Seven fire departments 
responded to the alarm, first 
called in by neighbors who 
noticed smoke coming from the 
church. A nearby activity 
center was not damaged. 

Some congregation members 
also responded to the alarm 
and served coffee and cold 
drinks to firemen as they 
fought the blaze. 

HAMLET 
SERVICE 

CENTER 
General Merchandise 

GAS&OIL 
Highway 561 

HOLLISTER, N. C. 

,<Haidwb. 
HAMBURGERS 

120 East l 0th Street 

Roanoke Rapids, N.C. 

Poge9 

t• 

Fire Damage 
Is Extensive 
At Residence 

Statesville - The family of 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Gabriel 
of 457 N. Tradd St. is in need of 
clothing following a fire at their 
residence recently at 7:48 p.m. 

The home, owned by 
Talmadge Adams, was ex­
tensively damaged by smoke 
and heat, with one bedroom 
being completely destroyed. 

The fire, according to Fire 
Chief Frank Crowson, started 
in the bedroom from a short 
circuit in an electrical cord. 

Twelve members of the 
Statesville Fire Department 
responded to the call. 

Booster lines and a one-and­
one-half-inch hose were used to 
extinguish the blaze but 
firemen could not prevent 
extensive damage to the 
dwelling. 

Clothing is needed for small 
children, ages four to seven, 
and one female adult, wears 
size 10 and 11. 

Anyone is asked to call 873-
3286. 

COMMERCIAL 

ROOFING 

co. 
PHONE 273-2188 

GREENSBORO, N.C. 

Mutual Savings 

& 
Loan 

Association 

Telephone 835-1522 
Elkin, North Carolina 

Branch Office: Yadkinville, N. C. 

Phone 6 79-8411 
Branch Office: Dobson, N. C. 

Phone 836-8116 

ROSE OIL 

co. 
158 By-Pass 

Henderson, N. C. 

NASH 
GARMENT 
COMPANY 
Manufacturers of 

Children's Dresses 

Dial 459-2127 
Washington Street 
Nashville, N . C. 

HERBERT 

GREEN 

AGENCY 

All Forms Of Insurance 
Doll 376-2408 

1445 E. 7th St. 
Charlotte, North Carolina 

Masten-Faison 
Weatherspoon 

Realty Co. 

Commercial Reel Estate 
Shopping Centers-Office 
Buildings-Industrial Porks 

Phone 333-9637 
217 South Church St. 

Charlotte, N. C. 

~ 

"Thanks For A Job Well Done To Our 
Voulnteer Firemen" 

BEAUFORT COUNTY HOSPITAL 

AMPHENOL DURHAM 
1 500 CLUB BL VD PHONE 688-6361 

DURHAM, NORTH CAROLINA 
Forest fires burn 
more than trees. 

Washington, North Carolina 

GLAM-0-RAMA CLEANERS 
& COIN LAURDRY 

90 Mintue Shirt & Laundry Service 

7:30 o.m.-7:30 p.m. Mon-Sot. Fast Sen,ic• 658•"8•5 

Mt. Olive, North Carorino 

I TURNAGE TIRE 
REBUILDERS 

All Work Guaranteed NEW & USED TIRES One Doy Service 
"One Of North Carolina's Finest Recoppers" 

DISTRIBUTOR FOR MUL Tl-MILE TIRES 
ROAD SERVICE 

Phone 2 37-5197 WILSON, NORTH CAROLINA 

Sponsored by 

I-XL 
FURNITURE 

co. 
Division of 

Westinghouse Electric 

Elizabeth City, N. C. 
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CITIZENS 
·SAVINGS & 

LOAN 
ASSOCIATION 

Training Fire Is Arranged 
And Set By Fire Department 

Phone 442-6165 

229 Sunset Avenue 

ROCKY MOUNT. N. C. 

Rocky Mount - For more 
than four hours recently, some 
14 members of the Rocky 
Mount Fire Department battled 
a house fire here at the corner 
of Columbia and Adams 
Streets. Unlike most house fires 
in Rocky Mount, this blaze was 

MOORING -WOODWORKERS 
Let us do your quarterbacking for you 

For Residential or Light Commercial Building 
See The Men On The Go 
N.C. State License #7008 

398-4725-109 BE. Main St.-Murlreesboro, N.C. 

TOMMY'S 
DRIVE-IN 

RESTAURANT 
DIAL 625-4656 

1731 N. 
Fayetteville St. 
Asheboro, N. C. 

HALIFAX 
FUELS, INC. 

H♦otfng Oil-Gos & Accessories 
(UNION 76) 319 Washington Ave. 

CAll 536-4501 Weldon N. C, I 

Triple.-H 
Restaurant 

Ph. 435-6152 

Bessemer City Rd. 

CHERRYVILLE, N. C. 

Bl-COUNTY 
GAS. INC. 

LP Gas & Appliances 

(UNION 76) 319 Washington Ave. 

CALL 536,4510 Weldon. N. C. 

VERMONT AMERICAN CORP. 
BOONE DIVISION 

BOONE, NORTH CAROLINA 

ST. MICHAEL'S 
CATHOLIC 
CHURCH 

FATHER GREGORY O.S.B. 
Phone 87 6-6212 

708 St. Michael's Lane 
Gastonia, N. C. 

IDLE HOURS 

AMUSEMENT 

& MUSIC CO. 

All Kinds Of Coin 
Operated Machin.es 
Installed On 
Commission Basis 
Used ~ecords-
25 Cents Each 

Phone 726-3582 
ATLANTIC BEACH, N. C. 

John A. 
Lowry 
Sales 

Recapping Supplies 
Materials Unlimited 

PHONE 272-6592 
866 HUFFMAN ST. 

GREENSBORO, N.C. 

CATAWBA 

RENTAL CO., 

INC. 

T ro ilers-T ractors-T rucks 
Long & Short Term 
Truck Leasing 
Monthly-Annually 

Serving Catawba County 

464-8990 or 459-7227 
N. Oxford, P. 0. Box 358 

CLAREMONT, N. C. 

THE PROVIDENCE CONVALESCENT 
RESIDENCE, INC. 

An Extended Core Facility 
For Long Term Chronically Ill & Convalescent Patients 

medlcare approved "One Of The South's Finest" 

l 53 Beds 7 Regislered Nurse On Duty • A.D.A. Supervised Diets •SpoclOus Dining & Lounge 

Area~ • Licensed By N.C. Stofe Boord of Health • Approved Bv The Joint Commin.ion On Ac­

cred,1ot1on 01 Hosp1tol. 

Diol (7C,,) 334 1671 300 Providence Rd. at Dartmouth Place 

Charlotte, North Carolina 

started by the Fire Depart­
ment. 

The fire was a training 
exercise designed to assist the 
department's newest recruits 
in understanding · and dealing 
with heat and smoke conditions 
common to real fires. The 
house used was scheduled to be 
demolished later this fall. 

"Outside of actl\81 
firefighting experience, this is 
the best way possible to build 
the confidence of our newest 
members," said the depart­
ment's Director of Training 
Capt. J . F. Lancaster. "In 
addition to putting out 14 
separate room fires in the 
house, we practiced rescue 
missions in the smoke-filled 
basement. As far as I'm con­
cerned -it was a · very sucessful 
exercise." 

Rocky Mount Fire Chief John 
Skyes who . was on hand to 
supervise the training exercise, 
expressed pride in per­
formance of the new recruits 
and in the department's 
veteran members for their 
_efforts Thursday. 

"I thought the new men acted 
with the professionalism of 
seasoned firefighters," said 
Chief Skyes. "It was a pleasure 
to watch them performing 
under true-to-life cir­
cumstances." 

Sykes said he was also proud 
of the several off-duty firemen 
who operated the pumps during 
the exercise. "They gave of 
their own time · to help the 
department better itself," he 
said. "I'm grateful to them." 

Mt. Tabor 
Food Market 

3327 Robin Hood Rood 
Call 723-3971 

Winston-Solem, N.C. 

Grandview 
Food Market 

Coll 924-1223 
Plolftown, N.C. 

CAROLINA 
PAPER ·MILLS, 

INC. 

ROCKINGHAM, N. C. 

. FIREMEN BATTLE BLAZE THEY STARTED - Some 14 mem­
bers of the Rocky Mount Fire Department spent more than 
four hours battling this house.fire at the corner of Columbia 
and Adams Streets which was started for training purposes. 
While neighbors and passers-by enjoyed watching the 
department in action, the firemen found the session to be 
successful in helping train the department's newest 
recruits. 

Rocky Mount Telegram Photo 

Love Valley 
Firm Burns 

Statesville-A fire of un­
determined origin razed the 
Rhyne Brothers Balloon Works 
in· Love Valley recently. 

The Central Volunteer Fire 
Department ·received the call 
al 11 ;Si p.m. and 25 volunteer 
firemen battled the blaze until 
5:30 a.m. the next morning. 

Damage was set at $27,000 
and the building was declared a 
total loss. Central Fire 
Department officials said the 
fire may have been caused by 
exploding paint. 

Members of the Trinity 
Volunteer Fire Department 
aided in fighting the fire. 

BALSAM 
MOUNTAIN 

INN 
Op.,, June 15 • Oct. 15 

"Quarter Mile Off 

Blue Ridge Porl<way" 

.Modified Am•rican Pion 
• 35Rooms 

.Oining & Banquet Facilities 

Avo~loble By Reservation 
Special Rotes Jun•S.pt.Oct. 
Dono Id & Elliobeth loBront 

--Prop.-
PHONE ,56-9,98 

(Waynesville Areo) 

Bo• E. - Bolsom. N. C. 28707 

Chick Haven 

Fire Put Out 
N. Wilkesbors-A mid 

morning fire did substantial 
damage to an incubator 
building at Chick Haven Farms 
east of North Wilk~§Wl'O, 

Fire department officials 
stated tbtlti IW .-· ~~.--t 
leaking stOTage ta n te , 
causing the blaze. As the oil and 
flames spread over the patch of 
hillside , a nearby building 
which housed incubators 
caught fire. Damage was 
restricted to the ceiling area of 
the structure. 

Units from the Mulberry­
F airplains, Mountain View, 
and North Wilkesbors Fire 
Departments, plus volunteers 
from other area stations, 
fought the blaze and brought it 
under control within thirty 
minutes after their arrival on 
the scene. 

Firemen speculated that a 
smouldering electric motor 
which was found near the fuel 
tank might have been the cause 
of the fire. 

Work was continuing near 
normal in the undamaged 
areas of Chicken Haven. 

'Firemen were successful in 
plugging the leaking oil tank. 

When all available hydrants 
were used, firemen pumped 
water from Mulberry Creek. 

Although there was burning 
oil, firemen were successful in 
keeping it from spreading to 
other buildings. 

DOUG'S REPAIR SERVICE 

N. C. Licent.e No. 4076 

RFD No. I 

Plumbing Controctor 
New lnstallotions-Repoits-Remodeling 

CALL 93,-7956 

Smithfield, N. C. 
Jl w 

PANCAKE HOUSE 

' 

•COMPlETE MENU 

• • UNClE JOHN'S 

FRIED CHICKEN 

•TAKE-OUT 

SERVICE 
Dial 446-6613 

Open 6 A.M. + 9 P.M. 
Located at Quality Motel Hal Orr's 

ROCKY MOUNT, N. C. 
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Fi rem en Lead Drive 

Continued From Page 2 

worked as an undercover man 
against the drug traffic in 
Wayne County and was a star 
witness in several cases -
some still pending. 

"If you think there is no 
connection between the people 
who blew up that agent and 

W.R. HELMS 

some of the people who sell 
heroin and marijuana to your 
sons and daughters - and the 
people who engage in stolen 
goods traffic - I suggest you're 
making a dangerous mistake," 
Price said. 

Firemen's Association 
President Dwight Rose said he 

GEORGE EDGAR 
SUMMERLIN JR. 

Goldsboro News-Argus Photo 

Smoke Detectors 

Continued From Page 2 

of manufacturers responding 
with information requested by 
the state building council and 
they offer detectors which meet 
all requirements. Crowson said 
the list, along with prices for 
the detectors, would be made 
avaiJable to the public upon 
individual request. 

COilliil'I.SffillEl 1ngram aald 

he had been very concerned 
about the methods and means 
for solving problems, in which 
the public might suffer from 
unfair practices. 

He stated the two main 
concerns as: unethical sales 
practices taking advantage of 
the emotional state of persons 
who have intimate knowledge 
of lives lost and the showing of 
horror pictures within in­
dividual homes by eager 
salesmen asking exorbitant 
prices on equipment offered for 
sale; and excessive cost of 
smoke detection devices which 
are now on the market which 
may not have been properly 
inspected or tested, thus giving 
false security. 

The council has recom­
mended a listed ionization 
battery-powered smoke 
detector for existing dwellings 
and apartments which would 
not have to be installed by a 
licensed electrical contractor 
and is very simple to install. 
The type is recommended to be 
md'de available to the general 
public by volunteer fire 
departments, rescue squads 
and civic organizations. 

Crowson has received in­
formation from the deputy 
commissioners of the 
engineering and building codes 
division and the fire and rescue 
training services division 

which listed, as a goal, even­
tually to install properly listed 
and tested smoke detection 
devices in all existing dwellings 
and apartments if it can be 
accomplished through a 
volwitary system of selling 
them to the public by volunteer 
organizations such as volunteer 
fire departments, rescue 
squads and civic oraantzaUons. 

Commissioner Ingram said it 
was his opinion that the 
volunteer groups undertaking a 
project of this kind would find 
excellent reception from the 
public and provide a trust­
worthy place for the public to 
do business and also provide 
excellent benefits to their 
organizations. 

CHARLOTIE 
PAINT CO., INC. 

We Solicit Your Plant 

Holly 
Farms 
Brand 

Poultry 
P.O. Box 965 

MONROE, N.C. 

THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK 

"Serving Stanley County for over a Half Century" 

FDIC Albemarle, N.C. 
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had been advised on the project 
in advance by Fire Marshal 
Carl Ray Coley. "I have been 
talking this up with the fire 
chiefs and all of them like the 
idea," Rose said. 

Specifically, firemen were 
called on to promote the 
marking and inventorying of 
personal property by use of 
electric engraving devices 
donated by Dewey Brothers 
through Helms. 

More than 250 of the devices 
are being placed in the bands of 
rural fire officials and law 
enforcement agencies in each 
community. 

Citizens are urged to use the 
devices - at no charge - to 
engrave their driver's license 
number on articles of value 
such as TV sets, radioes, sports 
equipment and other items that 
might be stolen. 

The same items are listed on 
an inventory sheet kept in a 
safe place. 

If the articles are stolen and 
are later recovered, they can 
be easily identified. This not 
only assures the owner of 
getting his property returned 
but it enables law enforcement 
officers to bring charges 
against those caught with 
stolen goods it was explained. 

"We have been embarrassed 
many, many times in this very 
court room because the owner 
of the property couldn't prove 
that stolen property belonged to 
him,' ' declared Goldsboro 
Police Lt. Bobby Williams as he 

addressed firemen in the 
District Court room last night. 

Through a computer system, 
stolen goods recovered in other 
cities can be traced to the 
rightful owner in 20 seconds if 
the engraving system has been 
used, Williams said. 

A big factor, though, is the 
deterrent effect. Property 
downers who have marked 
their valuables are given 
stickers to go on doors and 
windows warning the would-be 
thieves that the valuables are 
so identified. 

Firemen accepted leadership 
in the campaign with en­
thusiasm. 

George Edgar Summerlin, 
Jr., dean of Wayne's volunteer 
firemen and former fire 
marshal, motioned that the 
association seize on the project 
as an opportunity and a duty to 
their county. 

He said it afforded rural fire 
departments an unusual 
educational opportunity to 
acquaint their own citizens with 
their departments. 

Commenting on problems 
facing law enforcement of­
ficers , Summerlin noted : 
"They can't do it alone All you 
have to do is sit on the swit­
chboard here at the courthouse 
and take the calls to know that. 
They can't be everywhere at 
one time. But our departments 
are. This is one of the best 
projects I have ever heard of." 

In addition to the iden-

THE LAMB'S NURSING & 

CONY ALESCENT HOME 
Division of Pelcare 

Administrator - Clifton H. lamb 

Call 1-919-869-37S2 3830 N. Main St. High Point, N. C. 

McGee Contractors & 

Concrete Work 
600- A North long Street 

SALISBURY, NORTH CAROLINA 

CHIMNEY 

ROCK PARK 

THRILLING VIEWS, 
TRAILS 

BRING YOUR CAMERAS 

U.S. 74 & 64 
CHIMNEY ROCK, N. C. 

Ashe Oil 

Company 

In co rpo rated 

Phillips 66 

Phone 246-2421 

West Jefferson 

North Carolina 

SMITH DOUGLAS 
FERTILIZER 

COMPANY 
CALL 786-2808 

Mt. Airy, North Carolina 

... Budd-Piper Roofing 
Company, Inc. 

Contractors 

W. P. Budd, Jr. Pres.-Treos. 

B. M . Rose, Vice Pres.-Sec'y 

H. E. Wilson, Gen'I Manager 

W. C. Phillips, Asst. Sec'y & Treas. 

Roofing 

sheet Metal Work 

Waterproofing 

Monufacturrers 

Distributors 

Phone 682-2121 

506 Ramseur Street. P. O: Box 708 

Durham, North Carolina 27702 
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tification of property, the 
campaign also is expected to 
include a move to enlist 
widespread cooperation with 
law enforcement officers in 
reporting suspecteq criminal 
activity and other projects to be 
announced within the next few 
days, firemen were told. 

WILLIAMS 

ALUMINUM VENT 

FOUNDRY 

Phone 498-2658 

Box 276 

WORTHVILLE, N.C. 

RABUN GAP 

BUILDING SUPPLY 
Hardwar-Paint 

Building Materials For 

Contractors or The 

'do-lt-Yourselfer 

lawn & Gorden Supplies 

We Deliver 

Call 404-746-5304 
York House Rd. 

Rabun Gap, Go. 

SCOTTISH 
LAUNDRY 

& CLEANERS 

John Station Road 

Phone 276-3155 

Laurinburg, North Carolina 

POLKTON BARBER 
& 

STYLING SHOP 

OPEN 
Tues.-Fri. 

8 a.m. - 6,p.m. 
Sat. 8 a.m. - 4 p.m. 

Roffler Sculptur Kut 
Styling - Regular Cuts 

Appointments 
Required 

Call 272-5951 
Polkton, N. C. 
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@~wn 

Mortage Bankers 

Insurance Division 

Home Office 

Raleigh, N. C. 
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Final Inspection Made 
Continued From Poge 1 

turned over to the respective 
1 ire departments, police 
dl'partment. and town officials. 

on time," said Perry. A Sep­
tember 1 deadline had been set 
at the beginning of the project. 

Fire Destroys Trailer 

··we are very pleased that 
the construction was completed 

CORBIN HILLS 
GOLF CLUB 
18 HOLE CHAMPIONSHIP 

GOLF COURSE 

9 HOLES. PAR 3 

& 0R~ING RANGE 

Phone 636-0672 

SALISBURY, N.C. 

Tl~ S 

Cadillac-Olds 
Company, Inc. 

872,6301 

252 East 

Front Street 

Statesville, N.C. 

.Carolina 

Frame 

And Trailer 

Service, Inc. 
• 

600 J Belhaven Blvd. 
P. 0. Box 8182 
Hwy. 16 North 

Charlotte, N. C. 
Mr. Joe Carter 

Assistant Town Manager 
Donald Horton said Thursday, 
following the inspection, that it 
goes without saying that town 
office employees are "proud" 
of the newly renovated 
municipal building. He an­
nounced that an open house and 
formal dedication will be held 
in a few weeks, when citizens 
will be invited to take a look at 
the buildings. Some furniture 
and the draperies have not 
arrived yet, so the formal 
ceremony will be put off until 
all minor decorating details are 
taken care of. 

Architect Perry said that 
plans are also in the making to 
pave the parking lot between 
the municipal building and 
firestation. He said plans are 
being redrawn to take care o( 
parking at least 35-40 vehicles. 
The entrance to the lot will be 
from Vance Street. 

The total contract price on 
the municipal building and fire 
station project was $163,518. 
This included the contracts on 
general construction, plum­
bing, heating and air con­
ditioning, and electrical. It also 
included several small changes 
made in the design after the 
project was begun. 

Clegg Kearns 
Pontiac Co . 
SALES & SERVICE 

Phone 428-2532 

Star, N. C. 

RIVERLETT MOTOR INN 
AUTO IN-RESTAURANT 

Air Condoioned · Heoted Pool • Woll-to-Woll Corpet 

· V1s11 Our Resiouront & Try Our SOO 8igg1e Burger co«)( 1'! 

916- I 900 Bo, 35 Mogg;e Volley Moggie. N . C. 

N. C. ELE ... RIC MEMBERSHIP CORP. 

Phone 832-2055 
P.O.Box 1699 
Role,gh. N. C. 

YADKIN 
BRICK COMPANY, INC. 

Hondcroft Coloniol Brick 
Phone 463-3321 NEW LONDON, NORTH CAROLINA 

Morehead City-Fire left a 
ramily of five homeless and 
destroyed the family's 
belongings near Newport 
recently. 

A spok~sman for the Newport 
Fire Department said the 
trailer home of Ssgt. Henry 
Reynolds, his wife and three 
children, was gutted by the fire, 
which started as a result of 
overloaded electrical wiring in 
the master bedroom. 

The 1974-model, four-
bedroom trailer and its con­
tents were valued at $12,000, 
firemen said. 

Firemen were alerted at 7: 15 
p.m. by a neighbor in Brock­
well's Trailer Park, just off the 
Roberts Road, where the 
trailer was parked. 

The family had reportedly 
left the trailer a few minutes 
before the fire broke out, to 
take supper to Sgt. Reynolds, 
who was at work at Cherry 
Point. 

A 1,000-gallon tanker and a 
500-gallon pumper were 
dispatched to the scene by the 
fire department, and 30 
firemen answered the alarm. 
The trailer court is about three 
miles from Newport. 

Firemen brought the fire 
under control with minutes 
after arriving at the scene, 
using three hoses and 1,000 
~allons of water. 

The· wife of Sgt. Reynolds 
Mrs. Jackie Reynolds, passed 
out upon returning to the trailer 
park and learning about the 
fire. She was taken to Carteret 
General ffo•pltal by the 
Newport Fire Department 
ambulance, suffering from 
shock. She was released, the 
hospital reported. 

The family had bought the 
trailer just two months ago in 
Morehead City, firemen said. 

Operating the rescue am­
bulance were Fred Kelly , 
Charles Masters and Dick 
Luthy. 

CHILD CARE 

CENTRE 

Owner-Director 
Mrs. Joseph A. Bobbitt 

"Children Are Our Concern 

Phone 762-9637 
2901 Market 

WILMINGTON, N. C. 

NORTH CAROLINA BAPTIST HOSPITAL 

Baptist Hospital. With 666 Adult & 43 Bosinettes. Is Affiliated With The 

BOWMAN GRAY SCHOOL OF MEDICINE 
OF WAKE FOREST UNIVERSITY 

Winston-Solem, North Carolina 27103 

·• 

This mobile home was destroyed by fire just off the 
Roberts Road near Newport, with damage to trailer and 
contents estimated at $12,000. Looking over the damage 
are, from the left, Milton Gould, Newport fire chief; Allen 
Elliott, secretary of the fire department; and Zeb Tripp. 
fireman. 

Carteret Co. News-Times Photo 

Pre-Fire Planning 
Continued From Poge 1 

Inspector Readling says pre­
fire planning is perhaps "one of 
the most important programs 
ever undertaken by our office". 
It establishes a very important 
rapport between industry or 
business establishment, the fire 
prevention inspectors and the 
combat firemen". He con­
tinues, "We hope to eventually 
have in Mecklenburg County 
~P.d. However, man~ 

are mvolvet! "Iii ' 
depth planning and it will take 
time". 

The first thing that Inspector 
Readling does when he starts a 
pre-fire plan is to send a letter 
to the plant in question asking 
for information as to their 
insurance carrier. Many of the 
larger fire insurance com­
panies have map plans that can 
be useful in pre-planning. This 
saves hours of time. 

Montgomery 

Savings&Loan 

Association 

TROY, STAR & BISCOE 

NORTH CAROLINA 

H&N 
CHEVROLET 

CO., INC. 
N. C. Dir. No. 1543 
Mfg. Lie. No. 110 
Phone 447-3167 
HAVELOCK, N. C. 

The first thing that Inspector 
Readling does when he starts a 
pre-fire plan is to send a letter 
to someone who has the 
authority to give him a 
blueprint of the plant. Once he 
has studied this blue-print, he 
makes an "on-site survey". 
This survey allows him to 
determine the location of 
special hazards such as 
chemical storage, spray 
boo 

' mains, whether the building is 
sprinklered, shut-offs, exits, 
and any other pertinent in­
formation. Once all of this 
information is gathered, he 
completes a Video-Data Ter­
minal Form. 

The next step in is the 
computerizing of the vital in­
formation. It is placed on the 
computer with the Charlotte 
Fire Department. Should an 
emergency arise, it can be 
recalled in approximately 
thirty seconds and relayed to 
the fire scene. 

The final step in the prt--fire 
planning is a meeting between 
Inspector Readling and the 
chief officer in charge, should a 
fire occur at that occupancy 
and the first back-yp chief. At 
this meeting, the Chiefs are 
made aware of all information 
secured during this pre­
planning and they are then in a 
position to determine in­
telligently where to position 
fire apparatus in the event of an 
emergency. 

Fire Administrator, Dan J. 
Carpenter, says, "Inspector 
Readling was given the 
responsibility of initiating the 
pre-fire plan program and he 
has done an excellent job. It 
took a lot of initiative and 
ability and he has an abun­
dance of both". 

Flex-O-Lators, Inc. 
1417 Progress Street 

HIGH POINT, NORTH CAROLINA 






